
Mission statement

The mission of ASG is to promote the conser-
vation of the world’s antelope diversity and to 
contribute to the mission of SSC.

Projected impact for the 2017-2020  

quadrennium 

By the end of 2020, we expect that: the Ante-
lope Specialist Group’s (ASG) global framework 
for antelope conservation; road maps for all 
threatened taxa; action plans for key species; 
updated Red List assessments; advice to IUCN, 
CITES, CMS, governments and INGOs; support 
for project proposals; and dissemination of 
information will collectively have made a signifi-
cant contribution to stabilising and/or improving 
the status of antelopes and also to specific 
targets on the SSC Strategic Plan.

Targets for the 2017-2020 quadrennium

Assess

Green List: complete Green List assessments 
for 93 species.

Red List: (1) maintain regular updates of 93 
species’ Red List datasheets; (2) complete all 
(144) Red List reassessments.

Research activities: (1) enter baseline data for all 



Red List

i. An assessment update file for each species 
(total number of species 93) has been created. 
New data are added to the appropriate sections 
using track changes when they become avail-
able. (KSR #11)

Research activities

i. Information on species and subspecies from 
the African Antelope Database (East 1999) and 
Mammals of Africa Vol 6 (Kingdon & Hoffman 
2013) entered into Antelope e-database.

Plan

Conservation actions

i. Development of the Global Antelope Strategy 


